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The roots of education in Pickaway Township extend as 
far back as 1785.  The Northwest Survey Ordinance of 
1785 dealt with the surveying of the land north of the 
Ohio River and west of the Allegheny Mountains and 
provided that Section 16 in each township from this sur-
vey be used to support the public schools within the 
township. Each township consisted of thirty-six sections, 
each section being one square mile in area.  In Pickaway 
County, land east of the Scioto River was surveyed in this 
manner. 

The Continental Congress passed another ordinance to 
enable the 1785 Ordinance to be implemented.  The 
Northwest Ordinance of 1787 made provision for the 
division of the territory into states with a guarantee of 
religious freedom and civil liberty.  Slavery was prohibit-
ed and education and morality were encouraged.  This 
ordinance provided a school endowment of 704,000 
acres of land in Ohio alone. 

After becoming a state in 1803, the Ohio Legislature be-
came the agent to carry out the intent of the federal 
government.  Ohio was the first state to use this pro-
gram to support education.  Unfortunately, the program 
did not work very well because of the restrictions and 
obligations placed on the land leasers.  Changes were 
eventually made in this program. 

Three trustees and a treasurer were elected by the 
township to lease the land and collect the rent.  This rev-
enue was given to the education fund for schools.  The 
1817 Ohio Legislature granted a 99-year lease, renewa-
ble forever with an appraisal to be made every 33 years 
and the rent fixed at 6% of the appraised value.  As histo-
ry was to reveal, this legislation did not work as planned. 

The Congress of 1826 allowed for the lands to be re-
leased and sold.  The early settlers soon learned that the 
school land in Section 16 could be obtained at a cost far 
below the current market price charged for other lands 
by the United States Land Office.  However, the price for 
the school land was firm and full payment in cash was 
required on the date of purchase.  This was a hardship 
for some settlers. 

The early schools were closely associated with the 
church since parents wanted their children to learn to 
read the Bible.  When the early settlers wanted their 
children to learn to read, write, or learn arithmetic, the 
parents had to either teach them at home or have the 
ministers conduct classes in their churches or homes. 

Some parents felt that their children were needed to 
work at home and learn the family trade, not book learn-

ing.  These settlers were more concerned with survival 
and making a living from the land.  Therefore, there were 
arguments both for and against formal education.  These 
same arguments were held throughout early Ohio com-
munities. 

These early log schools were of primitive construction 
with puncheon floors or dirt floors.  The windows were 
covered with greased paper to let in light.  Lard was 
rubbed into the paper to make it more transparent.  The 
door was made of clapboards, rough boards which were 
hung on wooden hinges.  Pulling a string that lifted the 
latch on the inside opened it.  Tardy students who found 
no string outside knew that the teacher was conducting 
morning prayers and had to wait silently outside until 
the latchstring appeared. 

A fireplace with a stick and mud chimney and benches of 
split logs made up the furnishings of the school.  There 
were no single desks in these early classrooms.  The 
benches upon which the students sat had no support for 
their backs but were only slabs on rude legs.  The smaller 
children’s feet were too short to touch the floor.  Other 
slabs along the walls, supported on pins fixed at a proper 
slope in the logs beneath the windows were the conven-
ient writing benches for that day.  Several students spent 
the day facing the wall. 

The classroom environment was very uncomfortable for 
the children, especially since they had to sit still for many 
hours.  In winter, they huddled together in order to keep 
warm.  The children close to the fireplace were too hot, 
and those farthest away were cold.  Even in the later 
schools, heating was a problem with the coal burning 
stoves.  Sometimes it was so cold in the school that the 
homemade ink froze in the inkwells and the lunches 
brought from home were also frozen. 

An example of a log school 
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A teacher taught for twelve weeks at a rate of a dollar or 
two for each pupil per term.  Often the tuition was paid 
in wheat at fifty cents per bushel and the balance in 
cash.  At this rate a teacher could earn between twenty 
and forty dollars a term.  Free public education had not 
yet come to Ohio.  Those early settlers who could not 
afford the tuition did not send their children to school.  
Compulsory attendance laws were not passed in Ohio 
until much later. 

Because the students in the classes ranged in age from 
five to twenty-one years of age, the teacher had a hard 
job not to bore the students with the same lessons over 
and over.  The teacher had to teach all subjects at the 
different levels.  Some students would fall asleep while 
waiting for the teacher to get to their level.  Most of the 
instruction was devoted to reciting and memorizing, not 
a very exciting way to learn. 

Teachers had to deal with many of the same discipline 
problems faced by teachers today. Since some teachers 
were as young as eighteen, some of the students were 
older than the teacher.  These older students sometimes 
were discipline problems and harassed the teachers.  
Many a boy was punished for dipping a girl’s pigtail or 
braid into the inkwell. 

Discipline was sometimes harsh since most teachers 
used a leather strap or a hickory stick to punish stu-
dents.  “Taught to the tune of a hickory stick” was reality 
in those early schools.  Others were made to stand in a 
corner, wore a dunce cap, balanced themselves on a 
block of wood that rested on a small round log, or wore 
signs tied around their necks describing their misdeed.  
Parents seldom complained or criticized the teachers for 
the punishments meted out.  This was before parents 
knew they could sue the schools for cruel and unusual 
punishment or for denying certain rights. 

Since paper was very scarce on the frontier and quite 
expensive, most lessons were written on a small slate 
board that each student carried to and from school each 
day.  The teacher used a large slate at the front of the 
room.  In the age of computers, teachers today use 
whiteboards and smart boards along with a lot of tech-
nology that someday will be as outmoded as the black-
board.  

Textbooks brought from Pennsylvania and the Atlantic 
Seaboard States were used in these early schools.  This 
collection of textbooks included Murray’s English Reader 
with Introduction, Columbian Orator, American Precep-
tor, Testaments, old almanacs, Dillworth’s Speller and 
Webster’s Easy Standard of Pronunciation.  Pike’s Arith-
metic was the universal favorite.  If a teacher was unable 
to perform the “Rule of Three,” he/she lost the respect 

of both the pupils and the parents. 

Those who sought education for their children were sat-
isfied when their progenies could write simple sentenc-
es, could read the Bible or an almanac, and when they 
could understand the mysterious computations of num-
bers as to be able to determine the value of a load of 
farm produce.  The early settlers considered this crude 
instruction sufficient since they lived in an agrarian soci-
ety.  Any more education than this was regarded as dan-
gerous since many felt that education made boys lazy 
and tricky. 

It was also a popular belief that girls who could read and 
write were apt to fall easy prey to an unscrupulous suit-
or who might entrap these young ladies by exchanging 
love letters which an illiterate mother would be unable 
to decipher.  Thus, many girls failed to learn to write.  
Several of the children’s parents could only sign their 
names with an “X” and were unable to read. 

Teachers were also held in a strange light.  Many felt 
that teachers taught only because they were not capable 
of doing manual labor.  This myth has carried over into 
the present day as evidenced in the saying, “Those who 
can’t, teach.”  To be a good teacher requires many skills, 
hard work, and dedication to service.  All should consid-
er teaching as one of the best vocations that anyone 
could pursue. 

With the passage of the Ohio School Law of 1835, free 
public education had its inception.  School funds were 
now derived from the State School Tax, creating a new 
state fund of $200,000.  Also, money was still available 
from township school lands and from interest on the 
proceeds of section 16 land sales in each township.  Lo-
cal school authorities could also levy a tax on real estate 
to secure school funds. 

The townships were divided into school districts that 
same year. Schools were to be located near the center 
of each of the sections in each district so that students 
would not have to walk more than 1.5 miles to school. 

Each of these districts had three school directors who 
hired the teachers and were responsible for promoting 
education in their district.  These directors were elected 
for one-year terms.  Beginning in 1842, they were elect-
ed to three-year terms.  It was often very difficult to get 
people to serve on this board.  Men were reported to 
have walked for miles and visited many homes to find a 
successor to fill a vacancy before someone would agree 
to serve. 

In 1853, a law put the authority into the hands of a 
township board of education that hired the six teachers 
and a district superintendent.  One director from each 
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district made up the six-man board of the township.  The 
law of 1853 failed to abolish the former district directors, 
so confusion in jurisdiction lasted until 1890 when the 
township board was given full authority.   

The one-room schools that followed the log schools were 
usually made of wood until after 1850 when the first red 
brick schools were built.  The one-room schoolhouses 
were equipped with stoves, slate blackboards, recitation 
benches and desks, some double in size.  Some of the 
schools were very overcrowded. 

Teachers had to be at least eighteen years old during this 
era and had to know more than the pupils.  To ensure 
this, the teachers had to pass an examination at the 
county seat.  The county hired examiners to administer 
these tests.  The examiners of the common schools were 
appointed on a yearly basis and were responsible for giv-
ing an examination to every person wishing to be em-
ployed as a teacher.  If the person passed the test and 
had good moral character, a teaching certificate was is-
sued.  The examiner visited the schools and gave advice 
relative to discipline, mode of instruction, and manage-
ment of the schools.  The tests that the teachers took 
were very difficult.  Many teachers today with a college 
education would find these tests difficult to pass.  Each 
January the questions used that year appeared in the 
local newspapers.  Thus, the parents knew what type of 
educational background was expected of the teachers.  
Today’s teachers must pass a national teacher exam in 
order to be licensed to teach. 

The wages for these early teachers averaged $33.50 per 
month for the spring and summer terms and $40.00 a 
month for the longer winter term.  It appears that teach-
ers have always been underpaid and overworked. 

Prior to the Civil War, there were no compulsory attend-
ance laws.  In 1877, children between the ages of eight 
and fourteen were obligated under state law to attend a 
minimum of twelve weeks of instruction during each 
school year.  However, this law permitted many excep-
tions and was thus largely ineffective.  In 1890, the Ohio 
General Assembly made it compulsory for children be-
tween the ages of eight and sixteen to attend not less 
than sixteen weeks of school each year unless excused 
for some specific reason which was indicated in the law. 

On April 15, 1889, a state law required that a truant of-
ficer be hired in each township. 

The school year consisted of a winter term of six months 
and a spring term of three months.  The summer term 
was also three months and was usually not taught by the 
regular teacher.  School was in session year-round during 
the first hundred years of education in the township.  
Opening day for the students occurred during the first 

week in September, but the older boys did not have to 
report until the middle of October.  They were needed 
on the farms to cut and husk corn and to sow wheat. 
Very few older children attended the spring term be-
cause they were needed at home.  These students usual-
ly made up the work during the summer term. 

The parents were required to purchase the textbooks 
and supplies.  Since twenty years before the Civil War, 
the popular textbooks in the township included the 
McGuffey Readers and Ray’s Arithmetic.  These books 
were to be in continual use for several years.   In 1888, 
the schools in the district were using the following text-
books:  The McGuffey Spellers and Revised Readers, Bed-
path History, Ray’s Arithmetic, Harvey’s Grammar and 
Electric Geography.  Textbooks were re-evaluated every 
three years by the school directors. 

On May 4, 1891, the Ohio School Textbook Law was 
passed and the same textbooks had to be purchased for 
the entire township.  The cost of the most popular text-
books of the time were McGuffey Revised Electric Read-
ers from a cost of 13 cents for book one to 64 cents for 
book six, The McGuffey Electric Spelling Book for 13 
cents each, Ray’s New Primary Arithmetic at 11 cents, 
Ray’s New Practical Arithmetic at 38 cents, Ray’s New 
Higher Arithmetic at 64 cents, Ray’s New Elementary Al-
gebra for 60 cents, Harvey’s Elementary Grammar and 
Composition for 32 cents, Harvey’s Revised English 
Grammar for 49 cents, The Electric Elementary Geogra-
phy for 41 cents, The Electric Complete Ohio Geography 
for 90 cents, The Electric Primary United States History 
for 38 cents each, The New Electric United States History 
for 75 cents, Electric Physical Geography for 75 cents, 
and Hutchinson’s Physiology and Hygiene at 84 cents 
each. 

Starting in 1915, the school could only purchase text-
books that were adopted by the County Board of Educa-
tion.  Every five years textbooks had to be re-evaluated.   

The schools of the township will be long remembered for 
the great service they rendered to education and the 
children who attended these schools.  Many of these 
children became outstanding prominent adults who con-
tributed greatly to the improvement of our society.  Even 
with the lack of supplies, equipment and time, the little 
red schoolhouses provided the opportunity for much to 
be accomplished in the way of education.  The era of the 
red schoolhouses has passed into history leaving behind 
only memories of days gone by and a rich heritage for 
schools of the future.  The schools served their purpose 
well and it is up to the new generation to continue on 
the excellence in education that began with the one-
room schools. 
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The first schools in the township were held in log cabins 

and were supported by private subscriptions. According 

to Van Cleaf’s history of the county, Jesse Bartlett was 

one of the pioneer teachers from New England.  Van 

Cleaf states that the Rawl school house near Congo 

Creek was probably the first one built, and classes were 

taught by Hugh Hannagan.  The first log meeting-house 

built at Salem (Meade) in 1802 or 1803 was also used as 

a school.  David Jones taught at this school.   

The following article appeared in the August 13, 1935, 

Circleville Herald.  “The first country school established 

in Pickaway County was probably in sub-district No. 1 in 

Pickaway Township and located about six miles south-

east of Circleville.  A subscription paper stating the object 

and giving the of subscribers is as follows: “We, the sub-

scribers, citizens in the vicinity of Scippo Liberty school 

land, do hereby promise and agree to pay, or cause to be 

paid, unto Jonathan Craig, Richardson Cade and Andrew 

Kinnear, Jr., or either of them, or their successors, the 

sum annexed to our respective names on or before the 

first of May, next, for the special purpose of building a 

schoolhouse on said premises, and also to enclose a part 

thereof as a graveyard, which when free shall be free to 

all sects as a place of worship and to bury their dead in, 

providing the same don’t clash with the school. 

“Any of the subscribers to have the privilege to work out 

a part or the whole sum by them subscribed at ordinary 

wages.  In witness we have subscribed our names in the 

months of January and February, A. D. 1815.  David Kin-

near, for the land, $7.32.  Michael Earnest, $4.50. Francis 

Kinnear, 75¢.  Richardson Cade, $4.50.  Andrew Kinnear, 

Jr., $4.50, William Cade, 75¢. Jonathan Craig, $4.50. John 

Craig, $4.50. Hugh Craig, $4.50. Samuel Dresbach, $2.00.  

James Metzger, $1.00.  James Reed, $1.00.  William Da-

vis, $1.00.  Peter Apple, $4.00.  Daniel Dresbach, $2.00 

and Johnson Hunter, $1.00. 

“So it may be said that the above men were pioneers in 

Pickaway County education.  Their spirit and sacrifice 

made possible the creation of the first log schoolhouse in 

the county.  This primitive temple of learning was erect-

ed in February, 1815.  It was a substantial and comforta-

ble hewed log house, about 20x25 feet and perhaps 15 

feet to the top of the square, with a large open fireplace, 

black chimney and an oak shingle roof. 

For many years within this log house the schoolmaster 

with an occasional schoolmistress gave the customary 

instructions in ‘readin,’ ‘ritin’ and ‘rithmetic’ to the 

youths of the neighborhood.   

In 1852 this old log school was torn down to make way 

for a more pretentious frame building and the old logs 

and the other material were taken to Meade, three miles 

southwest, where it was again put up and improved and 

used as a dwelling for many years.” 

Pickaway Township was divided into nine school districts. 

The nine districts with red brick schools were Rice, 

school #1 and located on Zane Trail Road; Ebenezer, 

school #2 and occupied the spot where the township 

house is now located; Hitler or Ludwig, school #3 on 

Tarlton Road; Jefferson, school #4 and was on Route 23 

in the Jefferson Addition; Davenport or Emmett, school 

#5 on River Road; Congo or Wolfe, school #6 on Wolfe 

Road; Salem, school #7 on the Hayesville-Adelphi Road at 

Meade; Boggs, school #8 on Route 361 and Kingston 

Pike; and Warren or Oak Grove, school #9 on the Hayes-

ville-Adelphi Road and Pickaway-Salt Creek Township 

line. The Meade school was the largest with two rooms.  

M. D. Kreider and Charles Kreider taught at the Meade 

school in the early 1900s.  

These one-room schools housed students in grades one-

eight.  After completing the eighth grade, students who 

passed the Boxwell Examination 

could attend high school at either 

Everts (Circleville) or Kingston. 

In 1906 the Pickaway Township 

board consisted of President Wil-

liam Ludwig, Dennis Rader, Harry 

Calvert, Amos Hoffman, Charles 

Hall and E. C. Wilkins, clerk. 
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The following textbooks were adopted by the board in 

1906: Progressive Course in Spelling, The Baldwin Pri-

mer, Baldwin’s School Reading, Milne’s Arithmetic, Ray’s 

New Arithmetic, Harvey’s New Language Lessons, Har-

vey’s New English Grammar for Schools, Natural Geogra-

phy, McMaster’s History of the United States, Overton’s 

Applied Physiology, Spencer’s Practical Writing, Goff and 

Mayne’s Agriculture, Blaisdell’s First Steps with American 

and British Authors — revised, Peterman’s Civil Govern-

ment — Ohio Edition and Dryer’s Lessons in Physical Ge-

ography.   

 

Location of some of the one-room schools in Pickaway Township.  This map was designed by 

Terry Frazier, former president of the Pickaway County Historical Society. 
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Teacher, Harry Kraft 

Rice School was located on Zane Trace Road in Pickaway Township close to Thatcher. 
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Ebenezer School was located on Zane Trace Road and is now the Township House 
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The Ludwig/Hitler School was located on Tarlton Road near where the Hitler-Ludwig Cemetery is located. 
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The Jefferson School was located in the village of Jefferson  near the intersection of Tarlton Road and U.S. Route 23. 
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[This article was written from an interview with Gladys Rader 
Shepler in 1987 by Judy Beavers, an educator at Logan Elm 
High School.  Gladys Radar Shepler, a member of the first grad-
uating class at Pickaway, died at age 107.  The school was lo-
cated on River Road.] 

 
In the not-too-distant past, thirty students attended Dav-
enport School in Pickaway Township to learn the three 
R’s.  At the turn of the century the one-room brick school 
was located on River Road close to the place where Pick-
away County now has its airstrip.  It was typical of the 
schools of the era and one of nine in Pickaway Township 
alone. 

The bell on the school roof used to ring out a resonant 

reminder for the children to hurry to school on time, 

promptly at 9 a.m.  The children were expected to walk 

whatever distance necessary to reach the school.  Some-

times in the wintertime when the snow was high enough 

to make walking a mile or more difficult for little legs, a 

kind father might hitch the horse to the flatbed farm 

wagon and provide transportation to school for his chil-

dren and his neighbor’s. 

Inside the building, students found their places among 

four rows of wooden desks and nervously awaited their 

turns at the recitation bench in front of the teacher’s 

desk.  Four tall windows on either side of the room ad-

mitted ample light for the children to do their studies.  At 

the front, the teacher on the raised platform beside the 

desk waited expectantly as her little and not-so-little 

charges seated themselves. 

The teacher at the Davenport School provided instruc-

tion for eight grades and the children could begin at any 

time, but usually were five or six years of age.  They fin-

ished with the elementary curriculum when they mas-

tered the studies given, no matter what their ages hap-

pened to be.  In a farming community, it was not unusual 

for the older boys to get only three to four months of 

formal education during a school year in order to help at 

home on the farm during the harvesting and the planting 

seasons.   

Two features of the one-room school curriculum would 

be particularly appealing to children today.  There was 

by Judith Beavers 
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no homework assigned and there were no graded week-

ly quizzes and tests as such.  Once a group of children 

finished with the recitation of their day’s lesson, the 

teacher graded each child on his participation in the les-

son that day and sent the students back to their desks to 

prepare for the next day.  As a former student in a one-

room school observed, students were almost certain to 

master their lessons because in the course of eight years 

they would hear each of the lessons as often as eight 

times. 

The one-room school provided all the amenities of life.  

Children who needed a drink were sent to the cloakroom 

to get one from the pail and the community dipper kept 

there.  The older boys usually considered it a privilege to 

be allowed to pump the water for the pail daily.  For rest 

room breaks the teacher would dispatch the students to 

either end of a building containing outhouses and a coal 

shed just down the hill from the school.   

Students never complained about the school lunches, 

because each child brought his own lunch to school with 

him in a bucket.  Furthermore, the school’s central 

heating and cooling system always provided a comforta-

ble setting for the students.  During the warm months, 

air condition was provided by opening the windows, and 

in the winter a coal-burning potbellied stove provided all 

the warmth needed.  To sit near the central stove was 

not necessarily always an advantage, because some-

times the prankish older boys would make the fire too 

hot, much to everyone’s discomfort.  For those miscre-

ants, Davenport had its customary dunce’s stool in the 

corner, and the teacher had a continuous supply of 

switches from the trees outside to keep the students in 

line. 

As it is today, very often the children’s favorite part of 

the day was recess.  In the winter they played fox and 

geese when they could make the circular paths to play 

the game in the snow.  In fair weather there was tag, 

marbles, and baseball. If one of the children had brought 

his pocketknife, they could play mumblety-peg, a game 

in which the knife is tossed from various positions so 

that the blade sticks into the earth with the handle up. 

Often the schoolhouse was the center of several com-

munity social events.  Spelling Bees were contests held 

between schools. At box socials, suppers were prepared 

and carefully packed into beribboned boxes to be auc-

tioned to the highest bidder.  The proceeds were used to 

provide materials for the school’s operation.  At Christ-

mas the children took part in entertainments at the 

school.  Sheets on a wire across the front of the room 

were the curtains, while the teacher’s platform became 

the stage for the production. 

Once the students of Davenport School and throughout 

Pickaway County had mastered the three R’s according 

to their teachers’ expectations, the county superinten-

dent would administer the Boxwell Examination to certi-

fy that the students who so desired were ready to con-

tinue their education at Everts Building on South Court 

Street, which was the site of Circleville High School. 

But even in the early 1900s the one-room school was 

fast becoming a relic of the past, because in 1913 the 

nine schools in Pickaway Township were consolidated to 

form Pickaway Township Centralized School.  Its first 

graduating class in 1916 boasted two students, Ruth Rice 

and Gladys Rader. 

Although this picture was taken inside the one-room 
school at Washington Township District No. 4,  it is similar 
to the Davenport School Christmas Entertainment de-
scribed by Mrs. Gladys Rader Shepler.  
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No photos has been found for this school.  Congo or Wolfe School was located on Wolfe Road.   

Congo School was established in 1816.  The following 
notice appeared in the local newspaper. 

We, the undersigned citizens of Congo School District, 
deeming it highly important to erect a house on an eligi-
ble site in said district for the purpose of a school house 
for the education and edification of youth, do hereby 
voluntarily and reciprocally promise to pay to John 
Boggs, whom we appoint as treasurer the sums hereun-
to annexed to our names, in testimony whereof we indi-
vidually subscribe our signatures this first day of July 
1816. 

John Boggs            $ 4.00 
James Torbert  4.00 
John Steeley      4.00 
Elias Reed  4.00 
John Russell   4.00 
Thomas Barr  4.00 
John Grice and son 2.00 
Mrk Steeley  2.00 
Robert Little  1.00 
John Young  1.00 
William Boggs  1.00 
David Wolf  1.00 
Benedict Wrench 1.00 

Jonathan Ellis  1.00 
Joseph Perry  1.00 
John Bateman  1.00 
William Brittain  2.00 
Jesse Cook  2.00 
Jacob Wagner  2.00 
Samuel Boggs  1.00 
John Creviston, Jr. 1.00 
Moses  ??  2.00 
James Burns  1.00 
Jacob Wright  2.00 
James Hunter  2.00 
Thomas Lingrell  1.00 
 

This agreement was entered into by residents of Picka-
way Township to provide a school for their children.  The 
school has long ago disappeared and no trace of it is left.  
It was located on what is now known as Wolf Road, 
which runs south to the Ross County line at the location 
of Logan Elm State Park.   
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This school was located in Meade and had two rooms.  Two of the teachers  who taught here were M. R. and Charles Kreider. 
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Above is a photo of students who attended Boggs School during the 1912-13 school year.  The teacher is 

Samuel Lindsey. The school was located at the intersection of Kingston Pike and State Route 361. 
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This school district included the southwest section of 

Salt Creek Township and the southeast section of Picka-

way Township. It was originally a log structure built to be 

used both as a school and also by the M. E. Church 

around 1859. The building was taken down and replaced 

with a two-room brick school building erected on the 

same location, as shown above. This brick school was 

built up to the standards of the late 1800s complete 

with a belfry and a coal cellar. 

The school was a joint effort of the Pickaway Township 

and Salt Creek Township school directors. The students 

of Salt Creek Township who attended this school came 

from the area between the school and the imaginary line 

north from Prairie View Cemetery to the Heffner Road 

and south to the County Line Road, which was a crude 

mud trail at that time. 

Both townships used the building until they both consol-

idated their one-room schools into a centralized system. 

The Pickaway Township Centralized School was built in 

1912. The Salt Creek Township boys and girls attended 

the Whisler School until the Salt Creek Township Cen-

tralized School was built in 1916.The Oak Grove School 

building stood on the northwest corner of the intersec-

tion of Hayesville-Adelphi Road and the Salt Creek-

Pickaway Township line road, west of Whisler, and on 

land owned by George and Carolyn Minshall.  It has since 

been torn down. 

This land was deeded to the Pickaway Township school 

directors in 1851 by Josiah Francis, recorded in Volume 

25, page 531, Pickaway County, Ohio. 
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The history of the centralized Pickaway Township school 
began with the consolidation of the nine one-room 
schools in the township. This was during the time that 
the consolidation of schools was in its infancy.  A board 
of education was established to consider centralization.  
At the May 8, 1911, board meeting, it was decided to 
hold a special election on June 12, 1911, to see if the 
voters would approve the combining of the one-room 
schools.  At that election, the voters approved the pro-
posal by a 140-123 vote.  At that time, Henry R. Calvert 
was president of the board, and the other members 
were Dennis E. Phillips, T.  E. Ross and C.  A. Dresbach.  
The clerk was C. E. Wilkins.  During the September 4, 
1911, board meeting, the board resolved to secure land 
and money for the purpose of centralization. The board 
estimated the cost to be $30,000. 

There was a special board meeting held on January 8, 
1912, to select a site for the school.  At this time, there 
had been some changes on the board.  Willis Ludwig was 
now board president, and the other members were Hen-
ry R. Calvert, Dennis E. Phillips, Burr H. Rader, and Isaac 

E. Morris.  The first choice of the board members was 
the Ruggles Farm with the second choice being the 
Dreisbach Farm.  Five acres in the Ruggles woods was 
selected.  However, the Ruggles heirs refused to sell, and 
the board had to acquire the property through eminent 
domain.   

Early in 1912, the board 
met to decide what type of 
building to build and who 
would build it.  The board 
now consisted of Burr H. 
Rader as president, Dennis 
E. Phillips, Henry R. Calvert, 
Isaac E. Morris, John Penn, 
and Leo McKenzie as clerk. 

On September 14, 1913, 
the school opened its doors 
and 196 students entered 
the newly constructed 
school. 

 

Plaque on School Building 



19 

 

Horse-drawn wagons were originally used to bring the 
students to school.  In the school wagons at that time, 
seats were obtained by means of a pecking order.  The 
older, larger students would sit in seats near the center 
of the wagon.  These were the most desired seats on the 
wagon, especially during the winter months.  The coal oil 
heater was located in the center of the wagon and those 
sitting next to the heater benefited from the heat given 
off while the rest of the students were cold.  By 1930, the 
horse-drawn wagons were replaced by motor-driven 
buses.   

The school janitor lived in a house next to the school.  
This house was built from funds allocated by the school 
board.  John Stout was the first janitor and continued in 
that position until 1918.  He was succeeded by Lewis 
Smith until 1936. In that year Lee A. Smith took over that 
position.  Several custodians have followed over the 
years.  Lawrence McKenzie served for many years. 

Due to an increase in enrollment, there was a need for 
additional space to house the growing high school. In 
1927, an addition was built behind the 1913 building and 
the two buildings were connected by a long hallway.  By 
this time the total enrollment was around 300. 

Before the centralized school was built, if a student 
wanted to attend high school, he or she had to travel to 
Kingston or Circleville since there were no high schools in 
the township.  Once the centralized school was built, 
more and more students decided to pursue a high school 
education.   

Early records show that the students at Pickaway Town-
ship High School were able to get a good education.  
Credits were earned in subjects such as Advanced Alge-
bra, Plane and Solid Geometry, Public Speaking, Business 
Law, Physiology, and Agriculture. The required classes 
included English, History, Physical Education and the Sci-
ences.  In addition, there were several extra-curricular 
activities for these early high school students.  Choir, 

band, journalism, class plays, athletics and various clubs 
were some of the ways pupils could excel outside the 
classroom. 

The yearbook was called the Pickaway Mirror and the 
school newspaper was the Pickaway Pamphlet.  Later the 
school newspaper was the Pirate Blade.   

Pickaway Township High School had its last graduating 
class in 1960. In the fall of 1960, the high school students 
started attending the newly built Logan Elm High School.  
This school was built in Pickaway Township near the in-
tersection of Pickaway, Salt Creek and Washington 
Townships on property bought from Raymond Moats. 
This ended one chapter of the school but began another 
one. Pickaway Township School now housed only stu-
dents from  K-8. 

In 1971, the George D. McDowell Junior High School was 
built and named in honor of a former Pickaway County 
Board of Education Superintendent who served from 
1934-70.  Thus, Pickaway Township School lost its junior 
high school 11 years after losing its high school.  This 
made the building an elementary school housing grades 
1-6 since the kindergarten students went to the McDow-
ell building for a few years. 

Starting with the 2012-13 school year, Pickaway became 
a K-4 building with the students in grades 5 and 6 being 
transported to the Salt Creek Intermediate School. Thus, 
once again the number of grade levels at the school de-
creased due to reorganization. 

Over the past few years, voters had turned down bond 
levies at the polls.  That would change.  At the general 
election held on November 6, 2018, voters in the Logan 
Elm School District passed a bond levy.  The vote total on 
election night from the precincts in Pickaway and Hock-
ing counties was 3,211 in favor and 2,657 against.  It 
passed by 554 votes. 

The voters had approved building a K-12 building located 
just west of Logan Elm High School.  Although Logan Elm 
High School, which opened in 1960, would be razed, 
McDowell Middle School would become the administra-
tive center.  The state of Ohio agreed to pay approxi-
mately 30% of the cost of construction.  Local residents 
raised money to upgrade some areas of the new school 
that the state did not include in its package.   

On May 24, 2023, students left Pickaway Elementary for 
the last time.  When the last student left the building, 
formal education located in the township did not end like 
it did in the other townships. Education continues to 
thrive in the township since the new K-12 building is lo-
cated in Pickaway Township. 

Custodian’s House with school children on the school play-
ground swings during recess. 
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In the December 1913 issue of The Ohio Teacher on page 
201, we find the history of the dedication of the newly 
built Pickaway Township School.  The article reads as 
follows: 

The above is a fine picture of a fine building in Pickaway 
Township, Pickaway County, dedicated Oct. 31, 1913. 

The dedication of this township centralized school was 
one of the greatest events of the kind ever given in the 
county and was participated in by 600 people. 

The guests of honor were Frank W. Miller, state superin-
tendent of public instruction, F. B. Pearson, high school 
visitor of the O.S.U., and H. P. Folsom of Circleville, all of 
whom made splendid addresses. 

A banquet was served at noon, the tables being spread 
in the auditorium and playroom.  Parents and pupils 
were assisting hostesses.  It was really a basket picnic.  
The auditorium and playroom were beautifully decorat-
ed in flags and the high school colors, gold and black. 
White and pink chrysanthemums on the tables added to 
the decorative effect.  The scene was a pretty one and 
one that will long be remembered by all who participat-
ed in the festivities. 

Rev. George J. Troutman gave the invocation and the 
pupils furnished excellent music. 

Professor F. B. Pearson’s theme was “A Plea for higher 
Education as a Near Help to Humanity.”  

Frank W. Miller spoke on “The Opportunities of Educa-
tion.” 

Mr. Folsom delivered the dedicatory address, in which 
he said: “It is not only to dedicate this school that we 
assemble here today, but it should be the duty of all citi-
zens to dedicate their lives to the work of education.”  
He referred to the donation of $5,000 given by Nelson 

Hitler, one of Pickaway Coun-
ty’s substantial citizens, as a 
nucleus for a library for the 
school.  “It is a gift of this 
kind,” said Mr. Folsom, “that 
helps to build up a school.” 

The centralized school build-
ing is a two-story buff 
pressed brick structure with 
stone trimmings.  It is located 
on five acres of ground 
bought from the Ruggles es-
tate near Hoover station on 
the Scioto Valley traction line. 

It has seven recitation rooms, a teachers’ room, rest-
rooms, library, superintendent’s office, and auditorium.  
In the basement is a playroom amply large enough to 
accommodate all the pupils.  Toilets, lavatories, and en-
gine room are located in the basement.  The halls and 
rooms are fitted up with sanitary bubbling fountains; the 
building is heated with steam throughout.  It has fine 
large playgrounds. 

The present enrollment is 225 pupils, and they are taken 
to and from the school daily in ten large wagons. 

The school is under the supervi-
sion of Superintendent Edwin L. 
Daley, who is an experienced edu-
cator.  He is ably assisted by Miss 
Willie Lutz, principal, Miss Hannah 
McKenzie, teacher of grammar 
grade, Miss Hazel Hoffman, who 
teaches the intermediate grade, 
Miss Katherine McKenzie, teacher 
in the second and third grades, 
Miss Bessie Mowbray, primary 
teacher, and Miss Bertha Allen, 
teacher of music and drawing. 

John Stout, the janitor of the school, and his wife live on 
the school grounds in a neat five room cottage built by 
the board. 

The building was erected at a total cost of $35,000.  This 
does not include the cost of the grounds.  

On the board of education are President Burr Rader, 
Dennis Phillips, Isaac Morris and Henry Calvert. 

 

 

Plaque on School Wall 

Edwin L. Daley 
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Students arrived at school on horse-drawn school wagons.  Instead of parking along the road, they parked 

on the school lawn.   
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Hall connecting the two buildings 
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Cafeteria  
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Auditorium and seating 
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School auditorium during the final walk-through of the building in 2023 



37 

 



38 

 

This mural painted on the 

back wall of the stage by 

Lee A. Smith in 1928 was 

still there when the building 

was demolished in the fall 

of 2023.  Lee Smith was a 

1924 graduate of Pickaway.  

His graduation photo is on 

the right. 
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Basement 
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by Louise Stuckey 

On May 8, 1911,  the Pickaway Township Board of Educa-
tion met to decide to centralize the nine township 
schools into one building.   They set the public vote for 
June 12, 1911.  The members of the board were Presi-
dent H. R. Calvert, D. E. Phillips, T. E. Ross, C. A. 
Dresbach, and C. E. Wilkins, clerk.   

The results of the special election was 140 votes for cen-
tralization and 123 against. 

Following the favorable vote, the board met on Septem-
ber 4, 1911, to secure land and money for centralization.  
They set the figure at $30,000.  A special meeting was 
called on January 8, 1912, to select the school site.  The 
board’s first choice was located on the Ruggles Farm and 
the second choice was on the Dreisbach Farm.  The 
board members were President Willis Ludwig, H. R. Cal-
vert, D. E. Phillips, B. H. Rader, and J. E. Morris. 

The board offered to buy five acres in Ruggles Woods.  
The heirs refused to sell.  The board used the right of 
eminent domain to obtain the property. 

Early in 1912 the board met to start the building process.  
The board members now were President B. H. Rader, D. 
E. Phillips, H. R. Calvert, J. E. Morris, John Penn and Leo 
McKenzie, clerk. 

During 1912-1913, a new two-story buff pressed brick 
building trimmed with stone was built on the five acres 
in Ruggles Woods at a cost of $35,000. It consisted of 
seven classrooms, a teacher’s room, an office, home eco-
nomics and laboratory rooms, an auditorium, a library 
and restrooms.  In the basement was the furnace to pro-
duce steam heat and an engine room.  A five-room 
house was also built on the grounds for the custodian. 

Nelson Hitler, a local farmer interested in the school, 
gave $5,000 to be used in the library.  Some years later 
when he died he left in his will $104,000 for use in the 
library.  The interest only was to be used.  

In September 1913 the school opened with 196 students.  
On October 31, 1913, the school wad dedicated.  Six hun-
dred people gathered for the festivities including a very 
fine banquet.   

The children first were taken to school in horse-drawn 
wagons which were later replaced by motorized buses in 
the 1930s. 

Due to a fast growing enrollment, an east wing was built 
in 1927 at a cost of $45,000.  It included additional class-
rooms, a cafeteria, gymnasium, agricultural shop and 
restrooms.  The school was now on 14 acres of land. 

Over the years school spirit grew as the community took 
interest in school activities such as basketball, softball, 
baseball, volleyball and track, especially when Pickaway 
took part in the county and state tournaments.  Music 
was an important part of the activities.  There were oper-
ettas, concerts and county choruses and bands.  In the 
1930s and 1940s three professors from Capital University 
came one day each week and gave instrumental lessons 
to those who wished to have them.  Those three were 
Floyd Elliott, F. R. Todhunter and Edward Morrison.  That 
was the beginning of the school orchestra.  Other activi-
ties were the Future Farmers of America and 4-H clubs. 

By 1958 Pickaway Township consolidated with Salt Creek 
and Washington Townships to form the Logan Elm 
School District.  Logan Elm High School opened in the fall 
of 1960. 

Pickaway township School in 1913 

Pickaway School in 1930 
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Grades 1-8 continued at Pickaway until a new middle 
school , McDowell Exchange School, was built next to the 
high school in 1970. The school opened in the fall of 

1971 leaving only grades 1-6 at Pickaway.  In the fall of 
1985 kindergarten classes were moved to Pickaway.   
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[The following is a speech given by 
Gladys Rader Shepler at the 75th an-
niversary of Pickaway Township 
School.  She was a member of the first 
graduating class and gives infor-
mation about the first year of the 
school.] 

Early in the morning on the first Mon-
day in September 1913 ten men, each 
driving two sleek, glossy, big horses 
hitched to a covered wagon started 

on a long journey. Each had a different route to follow 
but all were headed for the same destination, the new 
Pickaway Township Centralized School. As they pro-
gressed down the road, they made a stop at each house 
along the way picking up all children of school age and 
some older children who had fallen by the way but were 
encouraged to try again. 

The wagons were enclosed by curtains that could be 
rolled up in pretty weather and buckled down in cold 
weather. There were benches parallel to the sides of the 
wagons that the children used for seats while in transit. 
In winter a small kerosene burner was placed in the cen-
ter of the floor of the wagon to provide warmth for the 
children. 

On arriving at the school all children were taken off of 
the wagons. They entered the school house by way of 

the big double front doors. Not knowing what to do or 
where to go, all were assembled into the auditorium to 
await further instructions while the ten men attended 
their horses. They put them in stalls in a barn built for 
that purpose and fed them. There they awaited the hour 
for their return trip home. 

That assembly meeting on that Monday morning so long 
ago was quite different from all others that followed. 

Mr. Edwin L. Dailey was the superintendent of the school 
at its inception. He was in charge of all activities at that 
point. We were assembled there, all different ages and 
sizes. Those who were to be the teachers were standing 
by, also awaiting further instructions. 

Mr. Dailey was a wonderful person. He was a teacher by 
profession and followed that way until health problems 
overtook him. He was a strict disciplinarian, believing 
that if you spare the rod you spoil the child. However, he 
was loving, gentle, kind and understanding, and the chil-
dren loved him. 

There was a no program of any kind this first Monday 
morning—just the business of getting each one assigned 
to his or her proper place. 

Mr. Dailey announced that all beginners were to go with 
the first grade teacher, and she very quickly gathered her 
group together and left the auditorium to go to their as-
signed home room. As each subsequent grade was given 

Gladys at age 107 

 

Gladys Shepler 
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their assignment, they too were escorted by their re-
spective home room teachers to their home rooms. 

At this point all elementary students had departed the 
auditorium leaving only those who were eligible for 
High School work. 

After having completed the required studies in eighth 
grade all pupils were required to take what was then 
known as the Boxwell Examination. If this test was suc-
cessfully passed, the pupils were graduated and given a 
certificate in recognition of this achievement. They 
were then ready to enter High School. Since there was 
no High School in Pickaway Township prior to 1913, the 
Board of Education was obligated to pay tuition to any 
High School in the state of Ohio for any child who re-
quested it. There were four students who had chosen to 
go to other schools—Ruth Rice and Thelma Merriman 
had each gone to Kingston High School while Ned Boggs 
and I, Gladys Rader, had chosen to go to Circleville High 
School. Therefore, in September 1913 the four of us 
were ready for the Sophomore year of work. 

All those remaining were uncertain about the future but 
Mr. Dailey quickly put them at ease. In his quiet, father-
ly manner he talked with them and admonished them 
that every child should have an opportunity to get a 
good education so he offered them that opportunity by 
allowing them to move right into their first ear of High 
School. Many of them took advantage of that oppor-
tunity and were successful but again there were those 
who were not. 

The building was so constructed to have four class 
rooms, a Superintendent’s office and a library on the 
second floor. Four class rooms and a teacher’s lounge 
were on first floor. All restrooms, a chemistry laboratory 
and a room for home economics classes were on the 
ground level. The auditorium was off the first floor level. 
The library was a gift from Mr. Nelson Hitler. He was a 
well-to-do farmer and greatly interested in the new 
school and wanted the library to remain in this school. 

The High School was staffed by the superintendent and 
two other teachers. Mr. Harry Tilton taught the science 
classes, Miss Willie Morris Lutz taught all English and 
foreign language classes while Mr. Dailey taught a lot of 
History—both ancient and modern. Miss Bertha Allen 
taught music in the grades and directed all singing in 
assembly. A piano was available and a high school girl 
usually played for assembly. 

The subjects I studied were Algebra I, Algebra II, Geom-
etry, Commercial Arithmetic, Latin I and II, German I and 
II, English, American Literature, English Literature, Phys-

ics, and Chemistry. All our text books were furnished. 
There was no such thing as a typewriter or television or 
any of the advantages that the children today enjoy. 

During our Junior year one girls dropped out to get mar-
ried and the only boy went into the service. We were 
actively engaged in World War One at that time. Conse-
quently there were only two of us left to carry on. It was 
hard to get deeply interested with only two in the class 
but we pursued it to the end and were graduated on 
the 19th day of May 1916. 

Discipline was very strict. There was no running or talk-
ing in the hallways. 

There was no cafeteria so each child had to carry his 
own lunch. Each sat in his own desk while eating lunch. 

When lunch was finished all were privileged to go out-
side. The big boys usually played baseball. I can remem-
ber only one side for the younger children to play on. 
They had other fun games such as tag, red rover, mar-
bles, fox and geese, mumbledy-peg and many others. 

This school was much too small to attempt to do any 
special programs at that time. 

There was no dress code. Girls wore dresses that 
reached their ankles, high top laced shoes and their hair 
in a knot on their heads. Most of the boys wore sweat-
ers and knicker-bockers—a style of short breeches, 
fitting loosely and gathered at the knee.  

I pause now and look back and think how nice it would 
have been if we could have enjoyed a Jr. Sr. prom wear-
ing a pretty long formal dress with our hair curled up 
around our heads awaiting a date who brought a cor-
sage and riding in a nice shiny car. 

My admonition to all children everywhere today is to 
make the very best of every opportunity you have, for 
you might need it when you go out to meet the world. 
This old world is nice but it can be very rough if you are 
not prepared to meet it. 
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The above payroll voucher reveals the names of the teachers at Pickaway during the 1913-14 school year.  The su-

perintendent was Edwin Daley and the principal was Miss Willie Lutz.  The teachers were Bessie Mowbray, Bertha 

Allen, Hannah McKenzie, Hazel Huffman and Katherine McKenzie.  Their signatures are on the right side. 
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Edwin L. Daley  1913-18 

Walter A. Downing 1918-23 

Benjamin L. Hanselman 1923-24 

Albert F. Cameron 1924-28 

Lester E. Seitz  1928-33 

Milton C. Warren  1933-36 

Myron T. Johnson 1936-40 

Carl S. Burger  1940-43 

John Boyd Hardin  1943-51 

Robert Seward  1951-57 

Edwin L. Daley 
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Miss Willie M. Lutz 1913-18 

Arthur E. Buchanan 1918-19 

Harold S. Irons  1919-20 

Lloyd Rees  1920-21 

Floyd R. Hartpence 1921-23 

Eugene G. McCoy  1923-25 

George E. Armstrong 1925-26 

Eugene Miller  1926-27 

Carl F. Doebler  1927-29 

Otto C. Meyer  1929-32 

Elwood C. Carpenter 1932-33 

Edward S. Fries  1933-35 

Carl S. Burger  1935-40 

Morris N. Taylor  1940-42 

John Harden  1942-43 

John O Eagleson  1943-47 

Robert E. Seward ** 1947-57 

Alfred Gabriel **  1957-82 

Ty Ankrom  1982-84 

Robert Fulton  1984-86 

Scott Wilson  1986-91 

Philip Roe  1991-99 

James Wolfe  1999-21 

Joanna Strawser  2021-23 

** From 1951-60, the superinten-
dent was also the principal. 

       Harold S. Irons     Floyd R. Hatpence 
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             Alfred Gabriel                                                             Tyrus Ankrom 

             Robert Fulton                                                                 Scott Wilson                                    James Philip Roe

                        James Wolfe                                                  Joanna Strawser 
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The five photos below are sections from a long scroll showing all the students at the school in 1923. 
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Marvin Rickert in front row with the bat 



57 

 

1918 

High School Students 1921-22 
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Sophomores 1928-29 
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The early Pickaway newspapers were called the  Pickaway News and then the Pickaway Pamphlet.  Later it was 
changed to the Pirate Blade.  The yearbook in the 1920s was called The Pickaway Mirror but later it became known as 
the Pickaway Pacer. 
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The school colors were black and gold.  The school mascot was the pirates.   

Boys Basketball Team 1921-22 
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1926-27 
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The first mode of transportation was horse-drawn school wagons.  In the 1930s they had gas-powered buses. 
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Gene and Carolyn Wright boarding a gas-powered bus 
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Gladys Rader and Ruth Rice 

1916 
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Vera Daugherty 

Gertrude Dumm 

Lois Dumm 

Marie McAfee 

Jessie Merriman 

Bernice Riffle 

Earl Smith 

Marvin Steely 

Turney Stevens 

Wilma Warner 

Ralph Woolever 

Shirley Anderson 

Ellen Brown 

Fred Dumm 

Mary Rader 

Lloyd Evans, Edwin Gehres, Glenn Rader 
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May R. Enoch 

Urice M. Hatters 

John W. Leach 

Ruth H. McKenzie 

Gay H Phillips 

Wayne B. Pontius 
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Ellen Dumm 

Lucille Evans 

John Kerns 

Neil Morris 

Howard Phillips 

Ruth Rader 

Kenneth Shepler 

Orwell Barr 

Julie Foster 

Alice Phillips 

Ned Phillips 
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Ernest Enoch  not pictured 
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Pickaway Township H.S. Graduates by Last Name 
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Pickaway Township H.S. Graduates by Year of Graduation 
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The end for the majestic Pickaway Township school began on September 26, 2023 and finished on October 3, 2023 
with the demolition of both the high school and elementary buildings.  Thus ended the 110 year history of the school 
that once stood along Kingston Pike.  The company in charge of the demotion was the Watson General Contracting 
firm out of Newark, Ohio. The company did very professional work on this project. 

Many fond memories still linger even though the school is no longer there.  The first building to go was the high school 
building.  David Beavers, along with a few others, provided photos of the demolition on each day of the process.   The 
drone photos were taken by Tim Ward.  The following pages show each day of the demolition. 

The high school building and connector building was the first to go. 
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The following pages are taken from the scrapbook of Miss Louise Stuckey who not only attended Pickaway as a stu-
dent but also taught at the school as a third grade teachers for several years.  Her scrapbook contained photos of 
many of her students as well as the speech she gave on the video celebrating the 75th anniversary of the school.  Her 
history of the Pickaway Township School appears earlier in this book.   

Also included in her scrapbook were several graduation bulletins from the 1940s to the early 1960s.  These bulletins 
give additional information about student life at the school.   

 

 

On the top left is a Pickaway 
Township School 1935 graduation 
photo of Miss Stukey while the 
photo on the top right shows her 
early in her career as a third grade 
teacher. 

The photo on the right shows her 
third grade students dancing 
around a maypole on the first of 
May in 1954.  This is one custom 
that has disappeared in today’s 
society and schools.   
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I am Louise Stuckey. I was a pupil at Pickaway School be-
ginning in the first grade in September 1923. My first 
grade teacher was Pearl Ringwald who rode the Scioto 
Valley Traction from Chillicothe to a little station 
(Hoover) across the field from Pickaway School. She 
walked from there to the school. I continued my elemen-
tary and high school  education, graduating in May 1935. 

The faculty during those years was superintendent Ben-
jamin L. Hanselman, A. F. Cameron, Lester Seitz and M. 
C. Warren. Teachers: Misses Ringwald, McKenzie, Pierce, 
Reichelderfer, Wood, Shaner, McNeal, Johnson, Wert-
man, Patterson, Radcliff, Brand, and Mrs. Althaus, Seitz, 
Warren, Carpenter, Myers, and Fries. 

I rode a bus to school. They were quite different than 
those of today. They were trucks not equipped with 
heaters for cold weather. We had to dress warmly. In 
1930 a new modern fleet of buses were purchased. 

I don’t recall the length of the school day, supposedly it 
was 6 – 6 ½ hours. The school year began in September 
after Labor Day and ended the latter part of May. 

We sat in stationary seats arranged in rows. We needed 
permission to leave the room or to speak in class. Our 
day began with the pledge to the flag, sometimes a short 
Bible reading, and a prayer. When dismissed, the class 
went in double lines. Sometimes when going to the bus 
in the afternoon we marched to music. 

Respect, citizenship, and sportsmanship were taught. At 
all times we were to show respect to teachers, class-
mates, and school property. Our hallways were quiet. 
Each classroom teacher handled problems. The superin-
tendent  was available if needed. 

Subjects taught in grades one through eight were read-
ing, arithmetic, English, history, geography, handwriting, 
spelling, health, music, and art. 

In high school we chose our own course of study. I had 
English, history, algebra, general science, biology, Latin, 
French, bookkeeping, typing, shorthand, physical educa-
tion and music. In our typing classes we were assigned a 
teacher to do her typing when needed. Also, I helped 
with the school paper. Mr. Althaus had a print shop. 

Our textbooks and a few workbooks were supplied by 
the Board of Education as well as writing paper and a 
new pencil beginning each six weeks. We had a library 
supplied by a gift from the will of Nelson Hitler, a former 
resident. 

Games: 

Our recess activities consisted of various games, tag, Red 
Rover, jumping rope, trapeze, swings, teeter boards, 
baseball, and basketball. 

The high school had a physical education program con-
sisting of games, baseball, basketball, volleyball, track, 
etc. 

Lunch: 

In my early grade school years, I brought my lunch from 
home in a lunch pail. A small cafeteria was begun a year 
or so before 1927. An addition to the building was com-
pleted then and was equipped with a bigger cafeteria. 
Some continued bringing lunches from home to eat in 
the classroom. It was quiet and we had time to eat. 

Clothes:  

Our clothes were mainly of the period, girls wore dress-
es, skirts, sweaters, socks or hose, and oxfords. Boys in 
grade school wore knee pants and shirts, sweaters, shoes 
and socks. High school boys wore trousers, shirts, sweat-
ers, socks and shoes. 

Special Activities: 

In elementary school we had a Better Citizens’ Club, and 
art and music activities. In high school there were local 
and county oratorical contests. 

In the music department three music professors came 
from Capital University to give instrumental lessons once 
a week which led to the beginning of an orchestra. 

Boys participated in FFA. There were 4-H clubs for both 
boys and girls, also sports, basketball, baseball, volley-
ball, and track. Since we lived in a mostly agricultural 
community, we had to help on the farm before and after 
school hours. All the activities were at school and church. 
We had no extra-curricular activities after school other 
than basketball practice and senior play practice. 

Special projects included oper-
ettas at Christmas for the ele-
mentary an alternating operetta 
or spring concert in high school.  
Lee Smith, one of the graduates, 
was quite an artist who painted 
the scenery for all the oper-
ettas. There was also a County 
Music Festival. 

 

 

Lee Smith 
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In my junior year I was one of seven others selected to 
sing in the All-State Rural High School Chorus in Colum-
bus which was composed of 650 voices from 1,000 appli-
cants. 154 schools from 55 counties participated. We 
sang for the program of the Ohio Education Association 
meeting and also made a radio broadcast. This was a 
great experience. We had senior class plays in the spring. 

Classes did not take field trips. Senior classes each fall 
went to Baker Art Gallery in Columbus to have their pic-
tures taken. The remainder of the day was spent visiting 
places of interest, such as the Statehouse, the Blind 
School, the Mental Institutions, the Dispatch Building, 
the AIU Tower (now the Lincoln-Leveque), and the His-
torical Museum, accompanied by their history teacher, 
Mildred Wertman. 

There was a period of five years after my high school 
graduation before I came as a teacher to Pickaway and 
began teaching third grade. That was in September of 
1940. I remained in that classroom for 35 years before I 
retired in 1975. It was an enjoyable and rewarding chal-
lenge, also a pleasant place to be. 

The only requirements asked of me as a new teacher 
were to live up to good moral conduct, try to attend all 
or most of the school functions, and be regular in attend-
ance. 

I taught only grade 3. My average enrollment was 33 pu-
pils. A few years I had 44 to 49 pupils. My beginning few 
years there were only 15 to 22 pupils. Throughout the 35 
years, I taught over 1,100 pupils. 

Our school day was 5 ½ to 6 hours. After the high school 
moved in 1960 to Logan Elm, the new centralized build-
ing, the elementary day was shortened because the bus 
schedules changed. 

Rules: 

Good citizenship, respect for teachers, elders, class-
mates, and school property were taught. Be kind and 
helpful to one another, and be a good sport. It was one 
of my pet peeves that we didn’t leave our classroom in 
the afternoon littered or disarranged. We were in line to 
come from the playground or to dismiss from the class-
room to the bus. Leaving the room was by permission. 
We had a small classroom library which the pupils were 
free to use. 

Subjects Taught: 

I taught reading, English, arithmetic, spelling, hand-
writing, science, social studies, and art until we had an 
art instructor in the district. 

 

Materials: 

The board of education provided us with basic texts, 
workbooks, library books, filmstrips, tape recorders, and 
art supplies. I also added books to the room library. The 
county bookmobile also came with additional library 
books. 

Discipline: 

There were problems occasionally that I took care of, but 
the superintendent or principal was available when 
needed. Talking and reasoning with the child helped in 
most cases. Sometimes a task to perform (cleaning the 
room, hall or schoolyard) would work. Missing playtime 
or being given an extra assignment was often used. In a 
few cases the paddle was used. 

Games: 

There were items on the playground such as the slide, 
swings, merry-go-round, teeter-totter, parallel bars, 
baseball, basketball, football, soccer, jumping ropes, and 
various games as tag, red-rover, fox and geese, etc. 

Lunch: 

When I first began teaching, only those who bought 
lunches went to the cafeteria. Those with lunches from 
home ate in the classroom. After the high school and 7th 
and 8th grades moved, we all went to the cafeteria. Our 
time was shortened and we had to eat fast. 

Clothes: 

Girls wore dresses, sweaters, slacks, ankle socks, oxfords 
or slippers. Boys wore shirts (striped or plaids), sweaters, 
trousers, or jeans. Some wore bib overalls, shoes, or ten-
nis shoes. 

Term:  

Before the 7th, 8th, and high school moved, school began 
after Labor Day and ended the last of May. After that 
move, school began the last part of August and ended 
the first week of June. 
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Special activities: 

Assembly programs—each grade was responsible for a 
program. One memorable one was a circus by grades 1, 
2, 3. Operettas were sometimes at Christmas or in the 
spring. We had Arbor Day programs. We had a couple of 
May Day Programs. Some special days Room Mothers 
had parties. There was a special trip to Columbus Zoo for 
those who had perfect attendance for the year. We went 
to the high school to see the Art Show or plays done by 
the high school students. 

Each spring we had a science project planting either 
flower or tomato seeds so that each child had a plant for 
their mother for Mother’s Day. We had some Arbor Day 
Programs for parents and planted some trees. 

We wrote and produced an environmental play along 
with an art project. 

One highlight of my teaching was my team-teaching pro-
ject. I had a beginning teacher to work with me for four 
years. Enrollment was large, and no extra room was 
available to divide the class; thus, I proposed this idea to 
have help. We used three panels to roll between two 
rows of desks to divide the room. We had some prob-
lems, but for the most part it was a worthwhile and 
pleasant experience.  

Teaching was interesting, challenging, and rewarding. I 
know that many of my pupils have extended their educa-
tion beyond high school. Some have become teachers, 
principals, college professors, engineers, nurses, dentists, 
doctors, secretaries, and beauticians. Fifteen are at the 
present time teaching in the Logan Elm School District. 
Two of those are father and son. Through the span of 35 
years I have worked with many teachers under the lead-
ership of Carl Burger, John Hardin, Robert Seward, Alfred 
Gabriel, and John Henn. 

In my 47 years as a pupil and a teacher at Pickaway 
School, many changes have been made. I have seen an 
agricultural area being taken over by industry and hous-
ing developments making for larger enrollments and 
thus consolidating with other schools to become the Lo-
gan Elm School District. 

Had I taught three more years I would have spent 50 
years at Pickaway. That shows you Pickaway School is a 
good place to be. 
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